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gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
 caring for each other, working together, always improving

	
    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-L-045






You asked:
1. Please could you share the information Swansea Bay Health Board (SBUHB) holds on the number of patients who have experienced contraceptive issues through faulty/improperly placed/non-properly functioning contraceptive implants (i.e. unplanned pregnancies). Please provide data annually for years 2017-most recent.
Swansea Bay University Health Board does not hold this information 
2. Please could you share the information you hold on the number of patients who have received a financial settlement from SBUHB relating to an unplanned pregnancy through the fault of improperly placed/faulty/ non-properly functioning contraceptive implants. Please provide data annually for years 2017-most recent.
None during this period. 
3. Please could you share the total number of patients who received contraceptive implants in SBUHB. Please provide data annually for years 2017-most recent.
[bookmark: _GoBack]This data was not recorded until 2019
2019 – 153
2020 - 593
2021 – 1124
2022 – 1068
2023 -1063

4. Please include: The financial sums delivered by the Health Board to the patients in question, if any.
Not applicable 
____________________________________________________________ 
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Pencadlys BIP Bae Abertawe, Un Porthfa Talbot, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR / Swansea Bay UHB Headquarters, One Talbot Gateway, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR
Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe yw enw gweithredu Bwrdd Iechyd Lleol Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board is the operational name of Swansea Bay University Local Health Board
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