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gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
 caring for each other, working together, always improving

	
    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-L-049






You asked:

1. If any, which software solution(s) are used to manage your corporate property/assets, ownerships and occupations, lease agreements and facilities management (CAFM), and who are your current provider(s)?

The Health Board uses Electronic Property Information Mapping Service (e-PIMS™) for Government Property Professionals.
https://www.gov.uk/guidance/government-property-unit-electronic-property-information-mapping-service

2. What is the start date and duration of the contract(s)?
This information is not held by the Health Board – see Q1.

3. Is there an extension clause in the contract(s) and, if so, the duration of the extension?
[bookmark: _GoBack]This information is not held by the Health Board – see Q1.

4. Has a decision been made yet on whether the contract(s) will be extended or renewed?
This information is not held by the Health Board – see Q1.

5. What is the annual value of the contract(s)?
This information is not held by the Health Board – see Q1.

6. What is the total contract value of each contract?
This information is not held by the Health Board – see Q1.

7. How was the contract(s) procured, e.g., framework/tender?
This information is not held by the Health Board – see Q1.

8. Who is the senior officer responsible for these systems?
This information is not held by the Health Board – see Q1.
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