gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser caring for each other, working together, always improving

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi. We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.

# Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-C-011

#### You asked:

I am researching how maternal vaccinations are delivered across the NHS. Could you please answer the following questions for me:

- 1. Can you please provide the number of sites within your Organisation that provide the following services:
  - Tdap (Pertussis)/whooping cough vaccination to pregnant women:
    hospital-based sites nil
  - Tdap (Pertussis)/whooping cough vaccination to pregnant women:
    community-based sites all 49 GP surgeries
  - Influenza vaccination to pregnant women: hospital-based sites nil
  - Influenza vaccination to pregnant women: community-based sites all 49 GP surgeries and local pharmacies. Also available through the two mass vaccination centres.
- 2. Of the total numbers of Healthcare Professionals that recommend/raise conversations regarding the Tdap (pertussis)/whooping cough vaccination to pregnant women across your Organisation, what is the estimated % of each of the following types of HCPs:
  - Practice/community nurse

I can confirm this information is not recorded centrally – please contact the GP surgeries who may be able to provide this information for you.

- Community Midwife
  - 14 antenatal care midwives
  - 4 freestanding midwifery unit midwives



Pencadlys BIP Bae Abertawe, Un Porthfa Talbot, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR / Swansea Bay UHB Headquarters, One Talbot Gateway, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR

# 42 community midwives

#### · GP

I can confirm this information is not recorded centrally – please contact the GP surgeries who may be able to provide this information for you. These recommendations are usually completed by community and antenatal clinic midwives

# Hospital Nurse/Midwife

All hospital widwives are aware of the importance of vaccinations and will have MECC (Make Every Conversation Count) discussions with pregnant women at every opportunity.

# Hospital doctor

Obstetricians have the same MECC responsibilities regarding vaccination discussions.

- 3. Of the total numbers of Healthcare Professionals that deliver the Tdap (pertussis) /whooping cough vaccination to pregnant women across your Organisation, what is the estimated % of each of the following types of HCPs:
  - Practice/community nurse/GP

All practice nurses/GPs depending on the surgeries individual set up. You will need to contact the practices individually for this break down.

## Community Midwife

Midwives are not trained to administer

## Hospital Nurse/Midwife

Midwives are not trained to administer

## Hospital doctor

Obstetricians do not administer

- 4. Of the total numbers of Healthcare Professionals that recommend/raise conversations regarding the influenza vaccination to pregnant women across your Organisation, what is the estimated % of each of the following types of HCPs:
  - Practice/community nurse I can confirm this information is not recorded centrally - please contact the GP surgeries who may be able to provide this information for you.
  - Community Midwife 100%
  - **GP -** I can confirm this information is not recorded centrally please contact the GP surgeries who may be able to provide this information for

you.

- Hospital Nurse/Midwife 100%
- Hospital doctor 70%
- 5. Of the total numbers of Healthcare Professionals that deliver the influenza vaccination to pregnant women across your Organisation, what is the estimated % of each of the following types of HCPs:
  - Practice/community nurse I can confirm this information is not recorded centrally - please contact the GP surgeries who may be able to provide this information for you.
  - Community Midwife 0%
  - **GP -** I can confirm this information is not recorded centrally please contact the GP surgeries who may be able to provide this information for you.
  - Hospital Nurse/Midwife 0%
  - Hospital doctor (Obstetricians) 0%
- 6. In the latest 3 month, how many vaccinations has your organisation delivered to pregnant women ONLY for:
  - Tdap (Pertussis)/whooping cough vaccinations at hospital-based sites - not applicable
  - Tdap (Pertussis)/whooping cough vaccinations at community-based sites I can confirm this information is not recorded centrally please contact the GP surgeries who may be able to provide this information for their practices for you.
  - Influenza vaccinations at hospital-based sites not applicable
  - **Influenza vaccinations at community-based sites -** I can confirm this information is not recorded centrally please contact the GP surgeries who may be able to provide this information for their practices for you.