[image: C:\Users\su001508\Desktop\New logos Swansea Bay\Abertawe_Swansea NHS Health Board.jpg] Cadeirydd/Chair: Emma Woollett
Prif Weithredwr dros dro/Interim Chief Executive: Dr Richard Evans

gofalu am ein gilydd, cydweithio, gwella bob amser
 caring for each other, working together, always improving

	
    Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 23-I-026






You asked:
Please can you address the following questions, for each calendar year, 2021 and 2022:

1. How many babies were diagnosed with a tongue-tie?
[bookmark: _GoBack]I can confirm that Swansea Bay Health Board do not hold this information centrally. Babies with suspected tongue tie are diagnosed and referred from a variety of departments, including but not limited to infant feeding coordinators, Maternity, GPs, Neonatal and Paediatrics. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

2. How many babies required the tongue-tie division procedure?
I can confirm that Swansea Bay Health Board do not hold this information centrally. Tongue tie division for babies is performed in a variety of services, including but not limited to – ENT, Dental, General Surgery, Neonatal and Maxillofacial services. The majority of these divisions would be performed in an Outpatient setting. SBUHB do not “code” our Outpatient procedures and therefore this number would not be held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

3.  How many babies received the tongue-tie division procedure?
Please see question 2. 

4. What was the average waiting time for babies with tongue-tie to receive the tongue-tie division procedure?
Please see question 2. 

5. What is the current waiting time for babies to receive the tongue-tie division?
Please see question 2.
6. How many babies currently have the tongue-tie diagnosis? 
Please see question 1. 
7.  How many babies are currently on the waiting list to receive the tongue-tie division? 
Please see question 2. 
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