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  Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 24-D-050





You asked:
1. Does the Health Board work with translation services that translate healthcare information communications, e.g. leaflets, letters, posters etc?
Yes. 
1. [bookmark: _GoBack]How many healthcare information leaflets/communications did the Health Board produce and print in FYE 2024?
We do not hold this information. There is no central printing of leaflets, each leaflet/communication is electronic and staff would print them off when needed.
1. How many of these were translated in multiple languages?
337 were translated into Welsh *

* Please note: This is based on our interpretation of what constitutes “healthcare information leaflets/communications”. 

In addition, we would use the Wales Interpretation and Translation Service for translation into any other languages.
1. Which languages does the Health Board normally translate healthcare information communications into?
Welsh.

1. How are healthcare information communications delivered to patients that are visually impaired?
Every effort is made to provide information in an accessible format.  For patients that are visually impaired, information may be provided in large print and/or electronic versions.  
In addition, as a public sector organisation our website must comply with the Public Sector Bodies (Websites and Mobile Applications) (No. 2) Accessibility Regulations 2018. As such the Content Management System used by our Health Board and others in NHS Wales includes the ReadSpeaker assistive technology, although many sight impaired users may use other screen reader software. We also structure and design web content to make the site as accessible as possible to screen readers.
1. What did the Health Board spend on translation services for healthcare communications in FYE 2024?
The Health Board employs three Full Time Equivalent (FTE) Welsh Language Translators on Band 5. A Band 5 for Financial Year End (FYE) 2024 starts at £28,834 per annum. In addition, our Communications & Insight, Communication and Engagement budget, spent £21,924 on translation costs in FYE 2024.
1. What did the Health Board spend on printing of healthcare communications in FYE 2024?
We do not hold this information. Please see response to Q2.
1. Please provide the name of the person responsible for managing the creation of healthcare information communications?
We do not have a specific person responsible for managing the creation of healthcare information communications.  
1. Does the Health Board offer in-hospital way-finding or signage in any language other than English?
Yes, all signs must be compliant with the Welsh Language Standards and displayed in Welsh and English.

_____________________________________________________________ 
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