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Please note that we have only been able to provide this information for the period 14.01.24 to 15.01.25. Due to the way that further historical information is recorded, to obtain this would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

This information has been provided for HM Prison Swansea only.

You asked:
1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners are identified as having type 2 diabetes? 
8 = 31-40 yrs
6 = 41-50 yrs
7 = 51-60 yrs
5 = 61-70 yrs

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners have been diagnosed with type 2 diabetes whilst they are in prison? 
<5* = 31-40 yrs
<5* = 51-60 yrs
<5* = 61-70 yrs

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prescriptions for Ozempic have been given to prisoners? Please detail the cost of one Ozempic prescription. 
<5* patients have received prescriptions for Ozempic. 
Current Drug Tariff price for Ozempic is £73.25

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prescriptions for Wegovy have been given to prisoners? Please detail the cost of one Wegovy prescription. 
Zero patients have received prescriptions for Wegovy. 
Wegovy prices range from £73.25 to £175.80 approximately. 

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prescriptions for semaglutide have been given to prisoners, not including the Ozempic and Wegovy brands? Please detail the cost of one dose of each of these prescriptions. 
<5* patients have received prescriptions for oral semaglutide. 
Current Drug Tariff price for oral semaglutide is £78.48 
  
1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners have been given physical health support for type 2 diabetes, such as a meal plan or an exercise regime? 
All patients are routinely offered this.

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners are identified when entering prison as being obese? 
197 patients had a BMI reading of 30-39.9

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners are identified when entering prison as being overweight? 
492 patients had a BMI reading of 25-29.9

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners are identified when entering prison as being underweight? 
52 patients had a BMI <18.5

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners are identified when leaving prison as being obese? 
Prisoner leaving weight on release is not recorded on our prison health data system. To obtain this would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners are identified when leaving prison as being overweight? 
Prisoner leaving weight on release is not recorded on our prison health data system. To obtain this would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

1. By year, age group and prison, how many prisoners are identified when leaving prison as being underweight? 
Prisoner leaving weight on release is not recorded on our prison health data system. To obtain this would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.


* Where fewer than 5 has been indicated we are unable to provide you with the exact number of patients as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
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We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
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