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You asked:
I am aiming to gather information on all digital technologies used for adult mental health services. I would appreciate as much detail as possible regarding the following questions:  
1. Please state any digital technologies, e-therapies, internet-delivered therapies, online or digital therapies, digitally enabled therapies or digital therapeutics for adult mental health problems that your Health Board service have been procured, contracted or are paid for by the service for use by service users. For example, these might include, but are not limited to, internet-delivered cognitive behaviour (CBT) with or without therapist support, smartphone applications, web applications or programmes, wearables (including devices or sensors) or extended reality technologies (i.e. virtual reality, augmented reality). Please format this as a list indicating which have been procured, contracted or paid for by the service.  
Swansea Bay University Health Board have not procured, contracted or paid for any of the above. 
2. Additionally, please state any digital technologies, e-therapies, internet-delivered therapies, online or digital therapies, digitally enabled therapies or digital therapeutics for adult mental health problems that your Health Board service uses or recommends to service users. For example, these might include, but are not limited to, internet-delivered cognitive behaviour (CBT) with or without therapist support, smartphone applications, web applications or programmes, wearables (including devices or sensors) or extended reality technologies (i.e. virtual reality, augmented reality). Please format this as a list indicating which are recommended and which are used by the Health Board.  
Please note: we distinguish between 1) used and recommended and 2) procured, contracted or paid for by the service based on the following:  
0. Procured, contracted or paid for by the service - these are technologies from suppliers that have been formally agreed and paid for by the Health Board to use in service.  
2.Used or recommended - these are technologies that have not been formally procured or contracted but might be suggested to service users (e.g. a list of technologies given upon referral, while on the waitlist for treatment, upon treatment commencement or completion) or used by clinicians in service.   
We recommend Silvercloud for clients with mild-to-moderate common mental health problems (signpost to self-referral).   
Silvercloud is paid for centrally in Wales (not by individual health boards) The delivery of Silvercloud in Wales is undertaken by Powys Teaching Health Board.
3.For the period of 2023/24, please provide any data monitoring information you collect on the technologies listed above. For example, the number of people that have been recommended or reported using the technologies, how long they continued to use the technology or whether there was a reported benefit from their use. Please state where this data is collected from (e.g. the technology providers or from the service). 
Swansea Bay University Health Board does not record this information. Powys Silvercloud project team provide overview of engagement/outcomes on All-Wales basis. For further information please contact: 
powysfoi.foi@wales.nhs.uk
4. Please list any separate Community Mental Health Teams (CMHTs) that run services on your behalf or in connection with your Health Board.  
There are no separate CMHT’s that run services on behalf of or in connection with Swansea Bay University Health Board. 
5. Please state any organisations or third parties (e.g. ORCHA) you may have partnered with or commissioned to create or provide an App Library.   
There are no organisations or third parties partnered with or commissioned to create or provide an App library for Swansea Bay University Health Board. 
6. For the period of 2023/24, please state the total number of people your Health Board treated for common mental health problems, including how many were treated for each problem.   
	Low intensity for anxiety
	128

	Low intensity for depression
	116

	High intensity therapy (clinicial condition not recorded)
	305

	ADHD
	9

	Anxiety
	83

	Anxiety & Depression
	94

	Depression
	28

	Eating Disorder
	33

	Emotional regulation
	200

	Intrusive thoughts
	14

	Low Mood
	10

	OCD
	71

	Trauma
	388

	Total
	1479
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