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  Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 24-F-011





You asked:
Please provide a breakdown of the above for the years 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023 and Jan - May 2024.
1) British Sign Language/Sign Supported English
a) How many requests have been made to the Health Board for BSL/SSE to English interpreters?
The Health Board does not hold this information centrally. *
[bookmark: _Hlk173996323]*Our individual departments arrange their own interpretation services via the Welsh Interpretation and Translation Service (WITS) and Wales Council for the Deaf, as and when required, therefore, to obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty-day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 
We can however confim the following from our finance system. These are purchase orders raised for all languages as below. A purchase could be cancelled for several reasons, for example, no longer required, interpreter not available on the day etc:
	Cardiff Council WITS Data
	
	

	Period
	No. of POs raised
	No. of POs Cancelled

	01/01/2020 – 31/12/2020
	650
	57

	01/01/2021 – 31/12/2021
	775
	63

	01/01/2022 – 31/12/2022
	1097
	51

	01/01/2023 – 31/12/2023
	1411
	88

	01/01/2024 – 31/05/2024
	327
	19




	Wales Council for Deaf Data
	
	

	Period
	No. of PO’s raised
	No. of PO’s Cancelled

	01/01/2020 – 31/12/2020
	212
	26

	01/01/2021 – 31/12/2021
	324
	13

	01/01/2022 – 31/12/2022
	478
	35

	01/01/2023 – 31/12/2023
	400
	16

	01/01/2024 – 31/05/2024
	179
	6



b) How many of these requests were confirmed/fulfilled?
The Health Board does not hold this information centrally. *
c) How many were fulfilled by staff and how many by agency staff?
The Health Board does not hold this information centrally. *
d) What were the main reasons for an interpreter being unavailable to attend any unfulfilled requests?
The Health Board does not hold this information centrally. *

2) Deaf Blind 
a) How many requests have been made to the health board for deaf blind interpreters?
The Health Board does not hold this information centrally. *
b) How many of these requests were confirmed/fulfilled?
The Health Board does not hold this information centrally. *
c) How many were fulfilled by staff and how many by agency staff?
The Health Board does not hold this information centrally. *
d) What were the main reasons for an interpreter being unavailable to attend any unfulfilled requests?
The Health Board does not hold this information centrally. *
3) Does the Health Board employ any BSL/SSE/deaf blind interpreters within the Health Board, on a full-time staff basis?
No
4) Does the Health Board have a contract with a video relay service?
Yes, via the Welsh Interpretation and Translation Service (WITS) and Wales Council for the Deaf contracts.

_____________________________________________________________ 
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