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You asked:
I’d like to obtain information in relation to Health Board expenditure on doctor recruitment through external agencies during the 2023/24 financial year and 2024/25 financial year to date (05/11/24), via the Freedom of Information Act 2000:
1. How much did the Health Board spend on agency locum doctors during the 2023/24 financial year and 2024/25 to date? Can you please provide a breakdown of how much was spent per grade of doctor, specialty of doctor and the number of total hours booked in each specialty 
Please note that we are not able to provide the information broken down by grade or hours booked by speciality, but we have provided the spend broken down by booking area and doctor type. Please note where a minus figure is included, this indicates a refund or credit note.
Key
SN – Singleton Hospital
MN – Morriston Hospital
NPT – Neath Port Talbot Hospital
CAMHS – Child and Adolescent Mental Health Service
CDU – Community Dental Unit
MH – Mental Health 
CCH – Cefn Coed Hospital 
OPMHS – Older People Mental Health Service
LPMHSS – Local Primary Mental Health Support Service


2023/24
	Subjective
	Cost Centre
	Expenditure

	Consultant (M&D)
	SN Haematology Medical Specialty
	510,193

	
	SN Oncology Medical Specialty
	589,407

	
	SN Endoscopy Suite
	59,454

	
	West Radiology Medical Specialty
	917,544

	
	Breast Services Medical Staff
	71,168

	
	CDU Medical Staff
	350,110

	
	MN General Medicine
	204,033

	
	MN Gastroenterology
	220,570

	
	MN Neurology
	9,936

	
	West Trauma & Orthopaedics Medical Specialty
	33,810

	
	NPT Adult Medical
	110,358

	
	Swansea Adult Medical
	100,764

	
	Swansea OPMHS Medical
	318,463

	
	Perinatal Inpatient Unit
	35,063

	
	CAMHS - Medical
	217,016

	
	MH Neath Comm Drug & Alcohol
	95,844

	
	Forensic Medical
	600

	
	LD Medical
	15,437

	
	HB Income & Expenditure
	63,027

	Consultant (M&D) Total
	3,922,798

	Other Career Grade (M&D)
	Occupational Health
	2,128

	
	West Radiology Medical Specialty
	59,479

	
	MN Radiology
	- 6,290

	
	MN General Medicine
	156,575

	
	Cellular Pathology
	- 1,188

	
	Swansea Adult Medical
	7,680

	 
	HB Income & Expenditure
	9,371

	Other Career Grade (M&D) Total
	227,755

	Drs/Dentist in Training (M&D)
	HEPMA - ePMA Readiness
	38

	
	SN Haematology Medical Specialty
	208,634

	
	SN Oncology Medical Specialty
	56,418

	
	Palliative Care Medical Specialty
	684

	
	Triage Service
	56,441

	
	NPT ECG
	276

	
	NPTH Radiology
	121

	
	SN Radiology
	660

	
	West Radiology Medical Specialty
	14,675

	
	MN Radiology
	- 5,935

	
	Breast Services Medical Staff
	6,920

	
	West General Surgery Medical Specialty
	19,913

	
	MN Acute Medical Unit
	264,654

	
	MN Emergency Department - Medical
	39,363

	
	NPTH General Medicine
	302,259

	
	MN General Medicine
	466,868

	
	SN General Medicine
	5,915

	
	NPTH Rehabilitation Medicine
	45,501

	
	NPTH Neuro-Rehab Ward
	4,800

	
	Podiatry Service
	91

	
	West Trauma & Orthopaedics Medical Specialty
	229,766

	
	SN Obs & Gynae Medical Specialty
	224,352

	
	WEST Paediatrics Medical Specialty
	160,787

	
	Neonates Medical Specialty
	11,935

	
	Point of Care Testing
	598

	
	Cellular Pathology
	7

	
	Laboratory Medicine
	6,449

	
	Spinal Medical Specialty
	1,573

	
	MN ENT Medical Specialty
	4,012

	
	Older Adult MH (Physio)
	26

	
	MN Dietetics
	43

	
	Swansea Physiotherapy
	0

	
	Chaplaincy Service
	1,643

	
	NPT Adult Medical
	91,922

	
	Community Acute Area 1 (Central Clinic)
	86,931

	
	Swansea Adult Medical
	217,194

	
	Rehabilitation Medical
	1,615

	
	Swansea LPMHSS
	28

	
	NPT OPMHS Medical
	65,437

	
	Swansea OPMHS Medical
	51,576

	
	Perinatal Inpatient Unit
	25,350

	
	CAMHS - Medical
	11,062

	
	MH Neath Comm Drug & Alcohol
	635

	
	Substance Misuse Medical
	4,340

	
	Forensic Medical
	167

	 
	HB Income & Expenditure
	26,151

	Drs/Dentist in Training (M&D) Total
	2,711,897

	Grand Total
	 
	6,862,450



April 2024 to October 2024
	Subjective
	Cost Centre
	Sum of GL Balance

	Consultant (M&D)
	SN Haematology Medical Specialty
	293,530

	
	SN Oncology Medical Specialty
	127,859

	
	Palliative Care Medical Specialty
	76,858

	
	West Radiology Medical Specialty
	562,188

	
	Breast Services Medical Staff
	100,622

	
	CDU Medical Staff
	123,568

	
	NPTH General Medicine
	264,828

	
	MN General Medicine
	146,199

	
	Rheumatology Medical Specialty
	97,997

	
	West Trauma & Orthopaedics Medical Specialty
	19,736

	
	SN Obs & Gynae Medical Specialty
	112,293

	
	West Community Paediatrics
	63,255

	
	WEST Paediatrics Medical Specialty
	2,650

	
	Swansea Adult Medical
	35,743

	
	Swansea OPMHS Medical
	285,498

	
	Perinatal Inpatient Unit
	140,121

	
	CAMHS - Medical
	222,014

	
	MH Neath Comm Drug & Alcohol
	82,738

	
	Forensic Medical
	200

	
	LD Medical
	113,384

	
	HB Income & Expenditure
	5,857

	Consultant (M&D) Total
	 
	2,877,139

	Other Career Grade (M&D)
	Occupational Health
	44,925

	
	West Radiology Medical Specialty
	5

	 
	MN Radiology
	· 6,290

	Other Career Grade (M&D) Total
	 
	38,640

	Drs/Dentist in Training (M&D)
	MN Anaesthetics
	2,730

	
	SN Haematology Medical Specialty
	35,049

	
	SN Oncology Medical Specialty
	117,152

	
	Palliative Care Medical Specialty
	3,938

	
	Triage Service
	53,018

	
	MN Pharmacy
	48

	
	Breast Services Medical Staff
	1,284

	
	West General Surgery Medical Specialty
	5,537

	
	MN Emergency Department - Medical
	14,678

	
	NPTH General Medicine
	57,185

	
	MN General Medicine
	86,259

	
	SN General Medicine
	27,241

	
	Podiatry Service
	207

	
	Rheumatology Medical Specialty
	5,511

	
	West Trauma & Orthopaedics Medical Specialty
	40,491

	
	SN Obs & Gynae Medical Specialty
	169,571

	
	West Community Paediatrics
	178

	
	WEST Paediatrics Medical Specialty
	49,263

	
	Point of Care Testing
	430

	
	Cellular Pathology
	51

	
	Cellular Pathology Medical Staff
	4

	
	Laboratory Medicine
	5,800

	
	MN ENT Medical Specialty
	4,930

	
	NPTH Occupational Therapy
	20

	
	Virtual Wards
	415

	
	MN Occupational Therapy
	37

	
	MN Dietetics
	540

	
	Chaplaincy Service
	101

	
	NPT Adult Medical
	162,591

	
	Swansea Adult Medical
	81,775

	
	Rehabilitation Medical
	11,552

	
	NPT OPMHS Medical
	69,317

	
	Swansea OPMHS Medical
	76,996

	
	Perinatal Inpatient Unit
	34,853

	
	CAMHS - Medical
	10,586

	
	MH Neath Comm Drug & Alcohol
	711

	
	Substance Misuse Medical
	3,592

	
	LD Medical
	13,616

	
	Swansea Community Resource Team
	-  14

	 
	HB Income & Expenditure
	3,090

	Drs/Dentist in Training (M&D) Total
	 
	1,150,331

	Grand Total
	 
	4,066,111




2. Can you please name which agencies provided the locum doctors relevant to the answer to my previous question (question 1) and the number of hours each agency provided?
I can confirm that this information is not held centrally by hours. To retrieve this information would mean a manual trawl of each individual invoice which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.  

2023/24
	Subjective
	Agency Name

	Consultant (M&D)
	CAER HEALTH SERVICES LTD

	
	D R A*

	
	MEDI TEAM RECRUITMENT LTD

	
	REMEDY HEALTHCARE SOLUTIONS LTD

	 
	SUPREMELOCUM SERVICES LTD

	Other Career Grade (M&D)
	ATHONA LTD

	
	BDI RESOURCING LTD

	
	BLUE ARROW LTD

	
	CAER HEALTH SERVICES LTD

	
	DOCTORS RELOCATE LTD

	
	EVERLIGHT RADIOLOGY LTD

	
	IMG CONNECT LTD

	
	INSIGHT HEALTH SCREENING LTD TA INSIGHT WORKPLACE HEALTH

	
	INSYNC CORPORATE HEALTHCARE LTD

	
	KAIZEN STAFFING SOLUTIONS LTD

	
	MEDI TEAM RECRUITMENT LTD

	
	NATION MEDICAL LTD

	
	PHARMENG LTD T/A PE GLOBAL HEALTHCARE

	
	RSG RADIOLOGY LTD

	 
	YOUR WORLD RECRUITMENT LTD

	Drs/Dentist in Training (M&D)
	ATHONA LTD



April 2024 to October 2024
	Subjective
	Agency Name

	Consultant (M&D)
	INSYNC CORPORATE HEALTHCARE LTD

	
	MEDI TEAM RECRUITMENT LTD

	 
	REMEDY HEALTHCARE SOLUTIONS LTD

	Other Career Grade (M&D)
	ATHONA LTD

	
	CAER HEALTH SERVICES LTD

	
	EVERLIGHT RADIOLOGY LTD

	
	INSIGHT HEALTH SCREENING LTD TA INSIGHT WORKPLACE HEALTH

	
	INSYNC CORPORATE HEALTHCARE LTD

	
	NATION MEDICAL LTD

	
	RSG RADIOLOGY LTD

	
	SIARAD MEDICAL SERVICES LTD TA DARCY HEALTHCARE

	 
	TENGAR LTD

	Drs/Dentist in Training (M&D)
	A N*

	Grand Total
	 


* We are unable to provide you with the specific names of these suppliers, as they use an individual’s name there is a potential risk of identifying the individual if this was disclosed. Therefore, the data is classed as personal data as defined under the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR. We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.

3. How much did the Health Board spend on agency fees/costs when recruiting doctors to fixed term or permanent contracts via external agency during each period (i.e. where an introductory fee was charged)? Can you please provide a breakdown of how much was spent per grade of doctor, specialty of doctor and the number of doctors successfully deployed.
I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To retrieve this information would mean a manual trawl of each individual invoice which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.  

4. Can you please name which agencies provided the work/doctors outlined in question 3 and how many doctors each one has successfully provided to the Health Board?
Please see question 3.

5. Has the Health Board conducted any overseas trips since 2022 to conduct recruitment activities for doctors? If yes, please state how much was spent on each separate visit, which agency was partnered with (if any) and how many doctors were successfully hired (and started in post at the hospital) as a result of each visit.
Since 2022, SBUHB have not conducted any overseas trips for doctor recruitment.
_____________________________________________________________ 
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