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You asked:
SECTION 1: Hospital Demographics
1. Please indicate your Health Board/hospital type and type of care:
Health Board/Hospital Type:
1. ☒ Acute
1. ☒ Mental Health
1. ☒ Community
1. ☐ Ambulance
1. ☐ Other (please specify)

2. Type of Care:
i) ☒ Secondary
ii) ☒ Tertiary
iii) ☒ Other (please specify) - Primary

3. Total Number of Beds: Please indicate the total number of inpatient beds in your hospital, including all types (e.g., general, ICU, maternity) if applicable. 
As at 31st December 2023;

	Type
	Site
	Type of Care
	Allocated beds (31/12/2023)

	Acute 
	Morriston Hospital
	Secondary & Tertiary
	741

	
	Singleton Hospital
	Secondary
	146

	
	Neath Port Talbot Hospital
	Secondary
	189

	Community
	Gorseinon Hospital
	Secondary
	30

	Mental Health
	Cefn Coed Hospital
	Secondary
	120

	
	Tonna Hospital
	Secondary
	24

	
	Caswell Clinic, South Wales Forensic & Psychiatric
	Secondary
	61

	
	TAITH NEWYDD (Mental Illness)
	Secondary
	28

	Learning Disability
	Dan Y Bont (Learning Disabilities)
	Secondary
	5

	
	Swn Y Nant (Learning Disabilities)
	Secondary
	5

	
	Llwyneryr Hospital
	Secondary
	13

	
	Laurals & Briary Continuing Care Bungalows
	Secondary
	8

	
	Brynafon Learning Disabilities Unit
	Secondary
	5

	
	Ty Garth Newydd (Learning Disabilities)
	Secondary
	5

	
	Meadow Court (Learning Disabilities)
	Secondary
	5

	
	Hafod Y Wennol (Hensol Hospital)
	Secondary
	8

	
	Ely Houses
	Secondary
	13




4. ICU/ITU Bed Count: How many beds are designated for intensive or high-dependency care? 
Morriston Hospital – 59
Singleton Hospital – 27 (includes Neonatal ICU)

5. Annual Admissions: Please provide the total number of patient admissions in the last calendar year. If exact figures are unavailable, please provide your best estimate.

	
	
	Patient Admissions 2023

	Type
	Site
	Emergency
	Maternity
	Elective Inpatient
	Day Case
	RDA

	Acute 
	Morriston Hospital
	43,055
	12
	5,597
	12,683
	129

	
	Singleton Hospital
	3,549
	10,450
	2,798
	17,690
	13,138

	
	Neath Port Talbot Hospital
	609
	10
	2,932
	10,467
	4,418

	Community
	Gorseinon Hospital
	43
	0
	259
	0
	0

	Mental Health
	Cefn Coed Hospital
	131
	 
	256
	0
	0

	
	Tonna Hospital
	43
	<5*
	27
	0
	0

	
	Caswell Clinic, South Wales Forensic & Psychiatric
	8
	0
	25
	0
	0

	
	TAITH NEWYDD (Mental Illness)
	<5*
	0
	6
	0
	0

	Learning Disability
	Dan Y Bont (Learning Disabilities)
	0
	0
	<5*
	0
	0

	
	Swn Y Nant (Learning Disabilities)
	<5*
	0
	<5*
	0
	0

	
	Llwyneryr Hospital
	15
	0
	<5*
	0
	0

	
	Laurals & Briary Continuing Care Bungalows
	20
	0
	0
	0
	0

	
	Brynafon Learning Disabilities Unit
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0

	
	Ty Garth Newydd (Learning Disabilities)
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0

	
	Meadow Court (Learning Disabilities)
	0
	0
	<5*
	0
	0

	
	Hafod Y Wennol (Hensol Hospital)
	0
	0
	<5*
	0
	0

	
	Ely Houses
	19
	0
	<5*
	0
	0



*Where fewer than 5 has been indicated we are unable to provide you with the exact number of admissions as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.

SECTION 2: Procurement and Inventory Management 
1. Formal Procurement Policies: Does your hospital have formal policies or guidelines for medical equipment procurement? 
1. ☐ Yes (please provide a copy or summary)
1. ☒ No - we use the same principles as the Public Contracts Regulations (2015 No. 102)

1. Designated Procurement Roles: Is there a designated individual or team responsible for managing the procurement of medical equipment? If yes, please provide the role(s) and a brief description of responsibilities.
1. ☐ Yes – Individual
1. ☒ Yes – Team
3 different Teams - Primary Care, Medical Team, Non-Medical Team   
Role - ensuring the right product, provision or service has been sourced and supplied efficiently and at the right price for SBU
1. ☐ No

1. Inventory Review Frequency: How often is your medical equipment inventory reviewed for excess or unused items? 
1. ☐ Monthly
1. ☐ Quarterly
1. ☐ Biannually
1. ☐ Annually
1. ☒ Other (please specify) Ad hoc, in conjunction with user requests and/or replacement strategies

1. Primary Sources for Procurement: 
What are the primary sources for your medical equipment procurement? 
Please indicate the proportion sourced from the NHS supply chain versus individual suppliers, and provide any additional details as applicable.
Direct and NHSSC. 70% direct – 30% NHSSC  based on past 6 months

SECTION 3: Waste and Disposal
1. Excess/Expired Equipment: 
What percentage of your medical equipment inventory was classified as excess, unused, or expired in the last 12 months?
Please provide a breakdown by equipment type, if available.
5%

1. Disposal Responsibility: Is there a specific role or department responsible for overseeing the disposal of medical equipment? If yes, please provide the role(s) and responsibilities. 
1. ☐ Yes – Individual
1. ☒ Yes – Department
Medical Equipment Management Services (MEMS) – for electro-medical equipment
1. ☐ No

1. Formal Disposal Policy: Does your hospital have a formal policy for the disposal of medical equipment? 
1. ☒ Yes (please provide a copy or summary of any policies)
Please see attachment 
1. ☐ No

1. Types of Commonly Disposed Equipment: Please specify the types of medical equipment most commonly disposed of due to expiry or non-use. Include examples and approximate percentages for each type, if possible. 
1. ☐ Surgical instruments
1. ☒ Diagnostic devices – 5%
1. ☒ Monitoring equipment – 17%
1. ☐ Imaging equipment
1. ☒ Other (please specify) - Therapeutic 50%, Life Saving 8%, Other 20%

SECTION 4: Sustainability and Environmental Impact 
1. Sustainability Initiatives: Does your hospital have a sustainability initiative for recycling, reuse, or redistribution of excess or unused medical equipment?
1. ☒ Yes (please provide details)
Recycle as per ISO 14001 requirements, Medical Equipment Auction Companies as part of All Wales contract award and agreement
1. ☐ No

1. Disposal of Excess or Expired Equipment: How does your hospital manage the disposal of excess, expired, or damaged equipment? Please provide a breakdown by disposal method and indicate the approximate amount (in tonnes) used per year for each method. 
1. Recycling – not recorded
1. Donation – 20%
1. General waste - not recorded
1. Other (please specify) - not recorded

SECTION 5: Policies and Compliance
1. Compliance with Disposal Guidelines: How does your hospital ensure compliance with national or NHS guidelines on the disposal and management of medical equipment? 
1. Internal audits  
Health Board Environmental Management Team
1. External audits
Certified external body
1. Regular staff training
Part of induction and basic staff day to day activities
1. Other (please specify)
MEMS local procedures

1. Internal Audits of Equipment Management: Has your hospital conducted internal audits within the last 12 months to assess the management of excess medical equipment? 
1. ☒ Yes (If yes, please indicate the frequency of audits and any key findings, if available)
Twice – approximately every 12 months
1. ☐ No



_____________________________________________________________ 
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