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  Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn y Gymraeg neu'r Saesneg. Atebir gohebiaeth Gymraeg yn y Gymraeg, ac ni fydd hyn yn arwain at oedi.  We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 24-I-020






You asked:

	Question 1: Does Swansea Bay University Local Health Board treat patients diagnosed with Lupus (systemic lupus erythematosus including lupus nephritis)?
	Yes

	
	If No, please see question 2
If Yes, please see questions 3 & 4

	
	

	Question 2: If Swansea Bay University Local Health Board does not treat Lupus (systemic lupus erythematosus including lupus nephritis) are patients referred to a tertiary/ specialist treatment centre?
	Not applicable

	
	If Yes, please state which treatment centre.

	Treatment Centre: 
	Not applicable

	
	

	Question 3:  Does Swansea Bay University Local Health Board have local guidelines/ clinical pathways/ protocols (including shared care protocols) for the treatment of patients diagnosed with Lupus (systemic lupus erythematosus including lupus nephritis)?
	No

	
	If Yes, please can a copy be provided

Not applicable

	
	

	Question 4: How many patients were treated at Swansea Bay University Local Health Board for Lupus using belimumab in 2023?
	I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. Our Pharmacy systems do not hold data down to diagnosis. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

	
	

	
	

	Question 5: How many patients were treated at Swansea Bay University Local Health Board for Lupus using rituximab in 2023?
	Not held - please see above.




_____________________________________________________________ 
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