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You asked:
In relation to suspected cancer diagnoses, particularly in relation to gastrointestinal, neurological, and oncological referrals, also in relation to the neurological inflammatory condition known as Arachnoiditis, please provide the following information:
[bookmark: _Hlk209776539]1. Arachnoiditis Recognition and Management 
1.1. What is the SBU's official diagnostic and treatment pathway for arachnoiditis, including all related clinical procedures, and how is this documented in patient records?
There are no specific treatment pathways or protocols for this condition. As this is a rare condition, clinicians would refer to UpToDate or DynaMed (clinical decision support programmes) for most recent management advice.
1.2. What are the treatment protocols followed by SBU for arachnoiditis? Please provide details on the recommended medical treatments, surgeries, pain management strategies, and any alternative therapies used.
There are no specific treatment pathways or protocols for this condition. As this is a rare condition, clinicians would refer to UpToDate or DynaMed (clinical decision support programmes) for most recent management advice.
1.3. Are there established protocols for interdisciplinary communication between neurology, orthopaedics, pain management, and spinal specialists when dealing with arachnoiditis cases? 
Please provide copies of relevant inter-departmental communication or memos on this subject.
There are no specific treatment pathways or protocols for this condition.
[bookmark: _Hlk209611033]1.4. How many cases of arachnoiditis have been treated by SBU in the past 5 years? 
Please provide an annual breakdown by department (neurology, orthopaedics, etc.) and the number of patients involved.
We have provided the number of patients that were admitted to one of our hospitals with a diagnosis of Arachnoiditis anywhere within that inpatient stay. We are not able to break down the data by department as due to low numbers of patients, there is a potential risk of identifying the individual if this was disclosed. Therefore, the data is classed as personal data as defined under the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR. We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
	Financial year
	Admissions

	2020/21
	8

	2021/22
	7

	2022/23
	7

	2023/24
	11

	2024/25
	5



1.5. Are there cases where a patient presenting with symptoms of arachnoiditis was misdiagnosed or failed to receive appropriate treatment within the required time frame? 
Please provide anonymised details of such cases (including the reasons behind the delay) for the past 5 years.
I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 
[bookmark: _Hlk209610884]1.6. Please provide internal training materials, meeting minutes, or any documentation showing how SBU staff are educated about arachnoiditis, including its long-term implications for patients.
This information is not held.
1.7. What evidence does SBU have to show that arachnoiditis is recognised as a condition that could significantly impact a patient’s life expectancy or quality of life?
This information is not held.
2. Neoplastic Syndromes and Cancer Pathways 
2.1. What clinical guidelines does SBU follow to evaluate and diagnose patients suspected of having neoplastic syndromes (including cancer), and how does this align with NICE guidelines and national cancer referral protocols?
SBUHB follow the NICE guidelines/National Optimal Pathways/Royal College/s publications.
2.2. How does SBU track and document cases where patients present with multiple red-flag symptoms but are not referred for oncology consultations? Provide any internal documents or case studies detailing this.
Not all patients with multiple red-flag symptoms will require oncology consultations and as a result, SBUHB does not track that each patient has an oncology discussion.  Multi-Disciplinary Teams should document within MDT outcomes, the reason a patient is not referred to Oncology but ordinarily would have, for reasons such as poor performance status/frailty or patient choice, or within clinical documentation such as letters or clinical notes within Welsh Clinical Portal if that decision is made outside of an MDT meeting.
[bookmark: _Hlk209611078]2.3. What are the specific criteria used by SBU to triage urgent cancer referrals? Is there a prioritisation system in place, and if so, what percentage of referrals meet urgent criteria versus standard?
The Health Board adheres to NICE cancer referral guidelines. Primary care referrals are made via the Welsh Clinical Communications Gateway (WCCG) and the Welsh Clinical Portal (WCP) is used as the system to electronically prioritise referrals.
For ALL cancer referrals received by SBUHB during 2024/25 financial year
45% had a priority of urgent, 55% routine		
For Urgent Suspected Cancer (USC) referrals received by SBUHB during 2024/25 financial year
100% were marked with a priority of urgent		
2.4. How does SBU manage delays in oncology referrals? Please provide documented instances from the last 2 years where cancer referrals were delayed and the reasons for these delays.
You clarified on 10th April 2025 that a delay is defined as any instance where a referral for oncology consultation does not occur within the timeframes recommended by NICE or other relevant protocols. The standard times for referral to oncology are typically within two weeks for suspected cancer cases.
We are unable to provide you with the level of detail you are seeking as to the reasons for individual delays as there is a potential risk of identifying the individual if this was disclosed. Therefore, the data is classed as personal data as defined under the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR. We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
2.5. What is SBU’s policy for using patient-provided evidence (such as private biopsy results, MRI scans, etc.) in cancer diagnosis and treatment?
SBHUHB does not have a specific policy on this matter.
2.6. Please provide data showing the number of patients who received delayed diagnoses of cancer, including any financial implications for the Health Board, such as medical costs incurred due to late diagnosis.
You clarified on 10th April 2025 that delayed diagnosis is when the cancer diagnosis occurs later than the time period considered clinically appropriate. For instance, it could refer to cases where the diagnosis is made more than 4 weeks after the referral, or beyond the time-frame recommended by NICE cancer referral guidelines or the health board's internal protocols.
You can find data on late-stage diagnosis on the Welsh Cancer Intelligence and Surveillance Unit (WCISU) website here - https://phw.nhs.wales/services-and-teams/welsh-cancer-intelligence-and-surveillance-unit-wcisu/ 
Please see questions 3.2 and 3.3.

In terms of financial implications, this would be individual to each patient and their circumstances, and cannot be quantified.

2.7. What percentage of oncology referrals through SBU do not meet NICE guidelines within the specified timelines for cancer referral?
Please see question 2.4.
3. Red Flag Symptoms and Cancer Delays
3.1. What is SBU's official policy regarding the recognition and referral of patients who present with red-flag symptoms for cancers (e.g., unexplained weight loss, persistent fatigue, etc.)? Please provide a copy of this policy and any updates to it from the last 2 years.
SBUHB do not have a specific policy on the recognition of referral of patients with red flag symptoms, we follow suspected cancer waiting times guidance. The Health Board also operates the rapid diagnostic service for vague symptoms. You can find information here - Rapid Diagnosis Centre - Swansea Bay University Health Board
3.2. When a patient reports cancer red-flag symptoms, what are the expected timelines for referral to an oncologist? How are these timelines monitored and enforced?
There are no specific timelines – National Optimal Pathways are utilised at which point referrals should be made and a decision to treat is made, this may differ by tumour site.  We monitor waits to decision to treat for all patients waiting first definitive procedure (31 days from pathway start) and actively seeking to improve waits within earlier in the pathway, including diagnostics.
3.3. How many patients within SBU who presented with cancer red-flag symptoms in 2024 were not referred to oncology in a timely manner? Please provide anonymised details of these cases, the delays, and the consequences.
I can confirm that this information is not recorded in this manner.
3.4. What additional protocols or referral processes are followed when a patient exhibits multiple red-flag symptoms simultaneously, such as unexplained weight loss, iron deficiency anaemia, and fatigue?
Please see question 3.1
4. Gastroenterology and Cancer Referrals 
4.1. What is the SBU target wait time for an urgent referral to gastroenterology for a patient presenting with iron deficiency anaemia, deranged bloods, and elevated IgA levels?
Patient referrals from a GP are reviewed within 1 working day and assessed using NICE criteria. Those meeting USC criteria are placed on the USC pathway. Those not meeting the NICE USC criteria are placed on the non-cancer pathway
4.2. How is a patient’s risk for cancer (e.g., GI cancers) assessed when they present with these symptoms? What referral prioritisation is given to these patients?
Referrals are reviewed daily in line with NICE guidance. Those with red flag symptoms are expedited to a USC pathway. If a patient develops new red flag symptoms whilst on the pathway their investigation would be expedited.
4.3. How are these cases documented, and what measures are in place to prevent miscommunication or missed referrals within the gastroenterology team?
All referrals are digital, added to the patients clinical record and auditable.
4.4. How are FIT test results used in the referral process?
Are there instances where an additional FIT test result accelerates a referral?
We are in the process of expanding FIT to IDA assessment in line with latest guidance. FIT is currently used for lower GI symptoms
Are there instances where an additional FIT test result accelerates a referral?
Yes, a positive FIT will expedite a referral to USC.
4.5. Please provide statistics showing the current wait times for GI cancer referrals within SBU and the proportion of these patients who experience delays.
As at October 2025, the waiting time for a first Outpatient appointment is within 10 days of referral. We do not record information on delays.
4.6. What are the procedures for biopsy prioritisation in suspected GI cancer Suspected cancers are prioritised on receipt in the cellular pathology service by two means; the detail on the request form completed by the submitting clinician and then by cross reference to a list of patients that are on the Single Cancer Pathway (SCP). This applies to a range of suspected cancer tissue types. These specimens are prioritised through the laboratory and highlighted to the consultant body for reporting.
Additionally GI cancers may have a CAN5 sticker added to the request form. CAN5 is an accelerated diagnostics process, introduced in January 2024, whereby an endoscopically suspected cancer is labelled ‘CAN5’ for expedited processing within the pathology laboratory and to reporting within 5 days.
Are there delays in biopsy processing for suspected GI cancer? Please provide anonymised data from the last 2 years.
The Health Board does not hold the information you have requested.
The National Cellular Pathology Dashboard indicates the following (in days):
	Year
	GI mean turnaround time
	GI median turnaround time

	2023
	21.87
	13

	2024
	13.75
	12


For pathology turnaround times the median value is often more helpful than the mean value. This is because some specimens require multiple genomic tests or reviews by other pathologists, which can extend the reporting period considerably.

5. Accountability for Delays and Mismanagement – Cancer Services
5.1. What internal mechanisms exist within SBU for tracking and addressing delays in cancer referrals and diagnoses? How are these delays documented, and what corrective measures are taken? 
Please see the answer to question 5.3
[bookmark: _Hlk209612191]5.2. How many complaints were filed in 2024 regarding delays in cancer diagnosis? How many of these complaints were upheld? Please provide anonymised details for all complaints. 
7 complaints in 2024. 2 were upheld, 5 are ongoing.
[bookmark: _Hlk209612364][bookmark: _Hlk212201024]5.3. What is SBU’s policy on accountability for missed diagnoses or delayed cancer referrals? Are individual staff members held accountable for delays in diagnosing cancer? 
This response relates to a Single Cancer Pathway and delays to first definitive treatment in a secondary care
The Health Board does not have a specific policy on this; however we closely monitor cancer patients breaching the 62-day treatment target, with regular accountability meetings held with Welsh Government. Potential harm from delays is reported through the Datix system (which is a web-based reporting and risk management system) and addressed via the duty of candour process. The Cancer Programme and Improvement Group (CPIG) is working to improve identification and management of harm related to cancer care delays. Radiology reviews missed diagnoses through REALM meetings, with learning discussed during individual appraisals. The Health Board is committed to timely cancer care at all stages and follows the established Framework for the Management of Performance Concerns – Doctors (attached) for addressing any recurring issues.
[bookmark: _Hlk209612537]5.4. Please provide data on the number of cases where a patient was misdiagnosed or failed to be referred for cancer treatment in a timely manner, resulting in worsened outcomes. 
I can confirm that this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of incident records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

6. Biopsy Turnaround and Priority Systems
6.1. What is the average turnaround time for biopsies in suspected cancer cases within SBU?
In SBU in 2024 the mean turnaround time for suspected cancers across all tissue types was 16.44 days, with a median value of 14. (Source: National Cell Path dashboard)
6.2. Is there a prioritisation system in place for processing cancer-related biopsies, and how does this work?
As per question 4.6
6.3. How many instances of delayed biopsy results have occurred in 2024? The health board only monitor weekly the number of cases waiting over 12 weeks for reporting. For financial year 2024/25 the lowest number of cases waiting over 12 weeks was 13 and the highest number was 1087.
What were the reasons for these delays, and what corrective actions were taken?
The histopathology service at SBUHB is facing sustained demand that exceeds capacity. Urgent and suspected cancer cases are prioritised, leading to delays in routine reporting. Long waits are monitored weekly, and the Health Board is addressing the issue through overtime, outsourcing, and a workforce review. 
7. Data Protection and Transparency 
7.1. What systems are in place to protect patient data from being altered or deleted without proper authorisation, especially concerning cancer diagnoses and referral data?
There is no specific system in place, however, we do have an audit trail by user, for the Welsh Patient Administration System (WPAS) & Welsh Clinical Portal (WCP).
7.2. What protocols are followed to ensure that patient data, including medical test results, is correctly transferred between departments and that all relevant information is recorded in their electronic health records?
WCP is the tool used to view test results.  It pulls data from the originating system and this data can be viewed but not altered.  
7.3. What measures are in place to ensure transparency in the management of cancer diagnoses, including the timely release of test results, and the sharing of patient data between departments?
Cancer diagnosis has a specific waiting time of 31 days to identify any suspected cancer in patients.  These tests will be prioritised over other requests. Again, viewing test results will be via the WCP.

_____________________________________________________________ 
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