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You asked:
[bookmark: _Hlk197940359]Under the Freedom of Information Act, I request the following information regarding the handling of patients with Ehlers-Danlos Syndrome (EDS) and its implications on spinal instability, injuries, and procedures within SBUHB:
1. Screening Protocols and Policies:
a. What are the current protocols and guidelines for screening and diagnosing Ehlers-Danlos Syndrome (EDS) and its associated spinal instability?
SBUHB do not hold any specific policies or guidelines relating to Ehlers-Danlos syndrome.

b. Are there specific diagnostic criteria in place for identifying EDS-related spinal instability during routine consultations, imaging, or examinations?
SBUHB do not hold any specific policies or guidelines relating to Ehlers-Danlos syndrome.

2. Referral and Treatment Protocols:
a. What are the referral guidelines for patients diagnosed with EDS who present with symptoms of spinal instability or related spinal conditions?
SBUHB do not hold any specific policies or guidelines relating to Ehlers-Danlos syndrome.

b. What is the recommended course of action for patients with EDS who report spinal pain, weakness, or neurological symptoms, specifically those at risk of spinal instability?
A patient with ligamentous laxity/ hypermobility spectrum disorders, which includes the EDS population, is evaluated biomechanically from first principles in relation to all spinal pathology. There are no known neurologic complications of EDS, specifically, but those with hypermobility syndrome, are more likely to report joint pains, believed to be due to ligamentous laxity. Ligamentous laxity can also increase the risk of AAI in the spine, due to the increased laxity of the C2 transverse ligament, as well as CCI in the cervical spine. There is no known dedicated screening programme in relation to cervical spinal instability and hypermobility disorders, however.

c. How are these referrals expedited, particularly when there is a history of trauma or injury?
A person with known hypermobility syndromes is likely to undergo MRI investigation, due to the reduced support provided by ligaments in the spinal column.

3. Spinal Injury and EDS-Related Vulnerabilities:
a. What procedures and policies are in place to assess the vulnerability of patients with EDS to spinal injuries, particularly after spinal surgery, injections, or epidurals?
SBUHB do not hold any specific policies or guidelines relating to Ehlers-Danlos syndrome.

b. Is there a risk assessment procedure in place specifically for EDS patients undergoing spinal procedures like surgery or injections?
There is no indication for a specific risk assessment in relation to hypermobility syndromes, including EDS.

c. What are the known risks associated with spinal procedures in patients with EDS, and how are these risks communicated to patients?
Informed consent is tailored to each individual and their own circumstances. For hypermobility syndromes, including EDS, the specific complications relating to spinal surgery include positioning, bleeding complications and fusion complications if spinal fusion is considered. The reported literature does not provide specific percentage risks of EDS - specific spinal surgical complications.

4. Consequence of Untreated Spinal Disc Injuries in EDS:
a. What are the clinical guidelines for managing untreated spinal disc injuries in patients with EDS, especially in terms of the risks associated with delayed intervention?
SBUHB do not hold any specific policies or guidelines relating to Ehlers-Danlos syndrome.

b. Are there any long-term outcomes documented for EDS patients who have suffered untreated spinal injuries, such as in the cervical or lumbar regions?
No

c. How does the NHS monitor and address the progression of spinal conditions in EDS patients with untreated disc injuries?
There is no recognised population of people with untreated disc injuries, beyond those who are awaiting consultation and management within the NHS.

5. Spinal Injections and EDS-Related Complications:
a. Are spinal injections, particularly corticosteroids and other spinal interventions, contraindicated in EDS patients, and if so, how is this communicated to the medical teams administering these treatments?
Spinal nerve root injections including corticosteroids are not contraindicated in Ehler Danlos syndrome (EDS) patients. There are some studies that mention that steroids 'may' be ineffective in patients with EDS. Our current practice is to offer local anaesthetic and steroid injection as first line. There are no separate guidelines in our department for patients with EDS regarding this. 

b. What are the guidelines for the use of spinal injections in EDS patients who may be at risk of developing complications such as arachnoiditis or spinal cord compression?
Complications such as arachnoiditis or spinal cord compression are very rare following the spinal nerve root injections typically performed in MSK radiology. Current practice guidelines for these procedures are generally the same for patients with Ehlers-Danlos Syndrome as for those without the condition. The use of image guidance—standard in radiology for nerve root injections—is specifically intended to enhance precision, minimize the number of needle passes, and reduce the risk of inadvertent injection into the spinal canal or blood vessels, thereby lowering the risk of complications.

c. Please provide any known data or case studies on the frequency of complications from spinal injections or surgeries in EDS patients, including complications like arachnoiditis, neurological deterioration, or permanent disability.
There is limited data from large-scale studies regarding the frequency of complications such as arachnoiditis, neurological deterioration, or permanent disability following nerve root injections in patients with Ehlers-Danlos Syndrome (EDS), largely due to the rarity and heterogeneity of the condition. In addition, for the types of image-guided spinal injections routinely performed in the radiology department, such complications are extremely rare. 

6. Training and Awareness:
a. What training is provided to healthcare professionals in identifying and managing patients with EDS, particularly in the context of spinal instability, spinal injuries, and related complications?
There is no specific training relating to management of hypermobility or ankylosing conditions. Each patient is managed according to their own individual risk profile. Those with hypermobility, for example, are more prone to joint dislocation under general anaesthesia if positioning does not consider this.

b. Are there specific training or awareness programs for those who perform spinal procedures or manage EDS patients in a clinical setting?
No

7. Policy and Protocol Updates:
a. Are there any planned or recent updates to policies regarding EDS patients and spinal care, particularly in light of emerging research on EDS-related complications?
SBUHB do not hold any specific policies or guidelines relating to Ehlers-Danlos syndrome.

8. Data on EDS and Spinal Instability Cases:
a. Please provide the number of cases involving spinal instability in patients diagnosed with EDS treated by your Health Board in the past five years.
There is not a database for these patients and therefore this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

b. How many of these cases required surgical intervention, spinal injections, or epidural treatments, and what was the outcome?
I request that you provide this information in the form of official documents, policies, procedures, statistics, and any relevant research or case studies.
Not applicable.
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