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Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-D-042





Please note that the Health Board is carrying out significant work around recruitment generally and has a dedicated area on its website for recruitment: https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/jobs/jobs-and-volunteering. Within this area of the website the Health Board has details of vacancies, up-coming recruitment days, contact information and short videos (developed in-house) advertising the benefits of working for SBU and interviews with staff. As well as emphasising the career and learning opportunities offered by being part of such a large NHS organisation, we actively promote the great work-life balance that living in Swansea and South West Wales offers, including affordable housing, our beaches, countryside, etc. 
Please note, we do everything possible to cover rotas with Swansea Bay staff and bank staff. It is only after exhausting these options, do we look to agencies for cover.
You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act, could you please provide me with the below information on Temporary Staffing Spend & Hours Data for the six-month period 01/10/2024 to 31/03/2025.

	Filled Shifts vs. Unfilled Shifts

	Period: 01/10/2024 – 31/03/2025
	Medical & Dental
	Allied Health Professionals (AHPs)
including Scientific, Therapeutic and Technical Staff
	Nursing & Midwifery
including Health Care Assistants (HCAs)
	Non-Medical Non-Clinical (NMNC)
including Admin & Clerical and Estates & Facilities

	Number of shifts filled by staff bank
	6668
	Not recorded by shifts
	51669
	8900

	Number of shifts filled by agency
	1933
	Not recorded by shifts
	11322
	Not recorded on system

	Number of shifts unfilled
	1018
	Unfilled not recorded
	16328
	3077

	

	Staff Bank

	[bookmark: _Hlk202961566]Period: 01/10/2024 – 31/03/2025
	Medical & Dental
	Allied Health Professionals (AHPs)
including Scientific, Therapeutic and Technical Staff
	Nursing & Midwifery
including Health Care Assistants (HCAs)
	Non-Medical Non-Clinical (NMNC)
including Admin & Clerical and Estates & Facilities

	Total bank spend
	£4,139,478.00
	£311,756
	£12,680,036
	£417,021

	Total number of bank hours worked
	61624.65
	609
	13628
	581

	Please can you provide the highest hourly rate paid to a bank worker? (including all worker cost elements only i.e. worker pay, NI, PAYE taxes etc.)
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades, specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Hourly Rate: £95.00 p/h, Time-in-Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**
	Not applicable, staff are paid at Agenda for Change rates + 12.07% for Annual Leave


	Please can you provide the average hourly rate paid to bank workers? (including all worker cost elements only i.e. worker pay, NI, PAYE taxes etc.)
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades, specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Hourly Rate: £85.00 p/h, Time-in- Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**
	Not applicable, staff are paid at Agenda for Change rates + 12.07% for Annual Leave

	Please can you provide the lowest hourly rate paid to a bank worker? (including all worker cost elements only i.e. worker pay, NI, PAYE taxes etc.)
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades, specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Hourly Rate: £75.00 p/h, Time-in- Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**
	Not applicable, staff are paid at Agenda for Change rates + 12.07% for Annual Leave

	

	Agency

	Period: 01/10/2024 – 31/03/2025
	Medical & Dental
	Allied Health Professionals (AHPs)
including Scientific, Therapeutic and Technical Staff
	Nursing & Midwifery
including Health Care Assistants (HCAs)
	Non-Medical Non-Clinical (NMNC)
including Admin & Clerical and Estates & Facilities

	Total agency spend
Please provide total spend including on-framework and off-framework spend combined
	£4,308,736
	£1,517,205
	£3,641,142
	£504,525

	Total number of agency hours worked
	14522.42
	26,382
	114677.63
	**

	What agency rate card is used?
	No Rate Card
	No Rate Card
	All Wales Framework
	No Rate Card

	What % of shift bookings were placed above the agency rate card?
	N/A
	N/A
	14.22%
	N/A

	Total off-framework agency spend
Please only include total off-framework spend
	£1,133,561
	£195,468
	£210,481
	£125,328

	What is the agency spend % of total pay bill?
	26%
	13%
	6%
	25%

	Please can you provide the highest agency margin (% or £pph) applied to an agency booking during this period?
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades and specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Agency Margin: 5% (or 8.00 p/h), Time-in-Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**
	** 
	** 
	**

	Please can you provide the average agency margin (% or £pph) applied to agency bookings during this period?
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades and specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Agency Margin: 5% (or 8.00 p/h), Time-in-Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**
	**
	No bandings as per rate card ***
	**

	Please can you provide the lowest agency margin (% or £pph) applied to an agency booking during this period?
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades and specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Agency Margin: 5% (or 8.00 p/h), Time-in-Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**
	**
	No bandings as per rate card ***
	**

	Please can you provide the highest hourly rate paid to an agency worker? (including all worker cost elements only i.e. worker pay, NI, PAYE taxes etc.)
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades and specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Hourly Rate: £100.00 p/h, Time-in-Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**
	**

	Please can you provide the average hourly rate paid to agency workers? (including all worker cost elements only i.e. worker pay, NI, PAYE taxes etc.)
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades and specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Hourly Rate: £90.00 p/h, Time-in-Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**

	No bandings as per rate card ***
	**

	Please can you provide the lowest hourly rate paid to an agency worker? (including all worker cost elements only i.e. worker pay, NI, PAYE taxes etc.)
For each staffing category, please include all booked staffing grades and specialties and length of time in post.
For example, for Medical & Dental please include ‘Grade: Consultant, Specialty: Haematology, Hourly Rate: £80.00 p/h, Time-in-Post: 6 Months’, with all staffing grades from Consultant through to FY1.
	**
	No bandings as per rate card ***
	**





** This information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 
*** Rate card for All Wales Framework
	Role
	DAYS
(Mon- Fri)
£
	NIGHTS
(Mon- Fri)
£
	SATURDAY
£
	SUNDAY
£
	BANK HOLIDAYS
£

	Unregistered

	22.06
	31.10
	31.10
	40.37
	40.37

	Registered / ODP

	25.38
	33.00
	33.00
	40.61
	40.61

	Registered Staff / Specialist
	31.38
	40.80
	40.80
	50.21
	50.21




	STAFF SUPPLIED
	DAYS
(Mon- Fri)
£
	NIGHTS
(Mon- Fri)
£
	SATURDAY
£
	SUNDAY
£
	BANK HOLIDAYS
£

	Unregistered
	15.27
	21.98
	21.98
	28.70
	28.70

	Registered / ODP
	27.49
	35.74
	35.74
	43.99
	43.99

	Registered Specialist
	33.62
	43.70
	43.70
	53.79
	53.79



Day – Monday to Friday 0800 – 2000 hrs
Night/Saturday – Monday to Friday 2000 – 0800 hrs, Saturday 0001 – 2359hrs
Sunday & Pub. Hol – 0001 – 2359hrs

Specialist is defined as: - A&E, ITU, NICU, PICU, CCU, MIU & Midwifery.



_____________________________________________________________ 
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