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You asked:
1. For each of the following financial years (24/25, 23/24, 22/23, 21/22, 20/21):

Please note that this information relates to both current staff and staff that have left employment with the health board.

a) The number of financial overpayments made to staff
2020/21	658	
2021/22	671 
2022/23	646 
2023/24	336
2024/25	476

b) number of financial underpayments made to staff
This information is not recorded by the Health Board. 

c) The respectively amounts of overpayments in GDP
2020/21	£933,837.47 
2021/22	£1,210,858.65
2022/23	£1,185,029.66 
2023/24	£553,303.76
2024/25	£1,159,882.38

d) the respective amounts of underpayments in GDP
This information is not recorded by the Health Board. 

2. And then the number of times bailiffs or any other debt enforcement agency was brought in to pursue Health Board staff in order to recover overpayments.
Please provide this for each of the following financial years: (24/25, 23/24, 22/23, 21/22, 20/21)
We do not refer any current employees to external debt enforcement agencies. This is recovered via internal methods such as Payroll deductions.

When an employee has left the organisation and has received an overpayment, the process to retrieve the debt (if not willingly returned) is on a case-by-case basis. The majority of cases that are referred to CCI (CCI Credit Management Agency) pay the debt via installments. 
The number of occasions that bailiffs have been instructed for these purposes is very low as the cost of the exercise often exceeds the value of the return. We are unable to provide you with the exact number of occurences as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
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