[image: C:\Users\su001508\Desktop\New logos Swansea Bay\Abertawe_Swansea NHS Health Board.jpg] Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board
Gwasanaethau Corfforaethol | Corporate Services
Un Porthfa Talbot | One Talbot Gateway
Parc Ynni, Baglan | Baglan Energy Park
Port Talbot SA12 7BR
Ffôn Phone: 01639 684 363
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You asked:
I would like to make subject access requests for the following information from Swansea Bay University Health Board. I would prefer the most current information of the patient demographic as it stands right now, but if you need to go back to a certain period, I would like the information from the last five years, please.
1. In children's diabetic services I would also like each of those questions split into age categories of 0-10 and 11-17 please.  So for example, how many children accessing diabetic services in SBUHB aged between 0-10 are T1 diabetic and how many aged 11-17 are T1 diabetic and so on.

a. How many Type 1 diabetics? 
I can confirm the total number is 176, of which 56 are aged 0-10 and 120 are aged 11-17
b. How many Type 2 diabetics?
I can confirm the total number is less than 5*
* Where fewer than 5 has been indicated we are unable to provide you with the exact number of patients as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.


c. How many of each type of diabetes are diagnosed or recognised as having a learning disability?   If possible, I would like the level of learning disability, if known, e.g. mild, moderate, severe and profound.  
This information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

2. In adult diabetic services please could these adults be split into age categories and levels of learning disability too?  For example: There are 347 Type 1 diabetics under the adult diabetic service with an identified learning disability.  Of the 347, 100 are aged 18-30, 100 are 31-59 and 147 are 60 and over.  Of the 100 aged 18-30, 42 have a mild learning disability, 28 have a moderate learning disability, 20 have a severe learning disability and 10 have a profound learning disability.  And the same for the other age categories please.

a. How many adults have T1 diabetes AND an identified learning disability?
b. How many adults have T2 diabetes AND an identified learning disability?  
If it is not possible to discern between the levels of learning disability, please could I just have the information of patients with all types of learning disability (not learning difficulty), their type of diabetes and their age category.  The recognition and/or identification of a learning disability - and not a learning difficulty, as the two are very different - is important.

This information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 
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