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You asked:

I would like to submit a FOI request for the following information concerning ADHD Services for Adults. if you require a time frame for this request to help retrieve the data, please use 2020 – current.

1. Does Swansea Bay University Health board have a specialist ADHD service for adults? If yes, can you give details please?
I can confirm that SBUHB does not currently have a specialist Adult ADHD service.
Referral Route: Patients must be referred to their local Community Mental Health Team (CMHT) via their GP, or the Single Point of Access (SPoA). 
Initial Appointment: The patient will be assessed to rule out other possible diagnoses, as ADHD symptoms can overlap with other mental health conditions.
If ADHD is suspected, the patient is placed on a waiting list for a DIVA Assessment (Diagnostic Interview for ADHD in Adults).
This assessment is comprehensive and may require multiple appointments.

2. Once a patient is referred to Adult ADHD services, what’s the target time for them to be seen for their first assessment?
From 2022 adult patients referred for ADHD are managed within the Community Mental Health Team, alongside other psychiatric symptoms in general Psychiatry. There is no dedicated pathway in place currently for ADHD. 
The first appointment is recorded on our patient information system as a new patient appointment under mental health and there is a target to deliver this within 10 weeks. If ADHD is suspected, the patient is added to the ADHD waiting list, which is part of the follow up pathway.

3. Once a patient is referred to Adult ADHD services, what’s the average time they are on a waiting list before their first assessment?

[bookmark: _Hlk193722340]Our new outpatient waiting lists do not identify if the patient is waiting for ADHD.  This information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

4. Can you provide the three longest periods of time a patient spent on the waiting list before their first assessment and their gender please?
We are unable to provide the three longest waits for ADHD assessment, because the ADHD pathway is currently sat within our general psychiatry services, we are unable to differentiate.  The Health Board have been working with clinicians and teams to develop our ADHD pathway and how we record new referrals.
This information is not held centrally. To Identifying the longest historical waits would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

5. How many patients are currently on the Adult ADHD services waiting list?
As of 31st July 2025 – 911 patients were waiting for an Adult ADHD assessment as part of the follow up pathway.

_____________________________________________________________ 
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We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
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