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Please note that the Health Board is carrying out significant work around recruitment generally and has a dedicated area on its website for recruitment: https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/jobs/jobs-and-volunteering. Within this area of the website the Health Board has details of vacancies, up-coming recruitment days, contact information and short videos (developed in-house) advertising the benefits of working for SBU and interviews with staff. As well as emphasising the career and learning opportunities offered by being part of such a large NHS organisation, we actively promote the great work-life balance that living in Swansea and South West Wales offers, including affordable housing, our beaches, countryside, etc. 
Please note, we do everything possible to cover rotas with Swansea Bay staff and bank staff. It is only after exhausting these options, do we look to agencies for cover.
You asked:
1) [bookmark: _Hlk206414480]What is the current vacancy rate for radiographers in your health board? Please also provide the average vacancy rate over each of the last five years.
I can confirm that the vacancy rate as of 11th August 2025 was 4.19%.  
We are unable to provide the average vacancy rate over the last five years because this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

2) What percentage of radiographers in your health board are currently over A) 55 years old B) 50 years old? 
I can confirm that on 30th July 2025, 25.35% of Radiographers in Swansea Bay University Health Board were aged 50 years+ and 18.31% of Radiographers in Swansea Bay University Health Board were aged 55 years+.

3) [bookmark: _Hlk206414499]How many times were agency staff used to plug gaps in radiographers in each of the last five years, plus the current year to date? Please also provide the total cost of agency staff for radiography in each period. 
[bookmark: _Hlk193722340]In relation to how many times agency staff were used; this information is not held centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

The total cost of agency staff for Radiography is shown below.
	Apr 20-
Mar 21
	Apr 21-
Mar 22
	Apr 22-
Mar 23
	Apr 23-
Mar 24
	Apr 24-
Mar 25


	£90,958
	£7,584
	£391,070
	£593,215
	£749,348
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We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
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