[image: C:\Users\su001508\Desktop\New logos Swansea Bay\Abertawe_Swansea NHS Health Board.jpg] Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board
Gwasanaethau Corfforaethol | Corporate Services
Un Porthfa Talbot | One Talbot Gateway
Parc Ynni, Baglan | Baglan Energy Park
Port Talbot SA12 7BR
Ffôn Phone: 01639 684 363
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You asked:
1. The number of individuals referred to NHS mental health services broken down by month. 
Of those identified please specify: 
a. Age category

	MONTH AND YEAR
	Age Group

	
	<18
	18-64
	>64

	January 2023
	<5*
	375
	219

	February 2023
	<5*
	323
	174

	March 2023
	<5*
	361
	176

	April 2023
	5
	337
	144

	May 2023
	<5*
	413
	204

	June 2023
	<5*
	437
	203

	July 2023
	<5*
	383
	176

	August 2023
	8
	365
	185

	September 2023
	<5*
	362
	180

	October 2023
	5
	414
	231

	November 2023
	<5*
	403
	206

	December 2023
	<5*
	340
	170

	January 2024
	5
	430
	210

	February 2024
	<5*
	480
	224

	March 2024
	6
	379
	203

	April 2024
	<5*
	416
	205

	May 2024
	6
	354
	193

	June 2024
	<5*
	356
	205

	July 2024
	<5*
	514
	284

	August 2024
	<5*
	378
	219

	September 2024
	5
	493
	204

	October 2024
	12
	573
	273

	November 2024
	<5*
	479
	207

	December 2024
	<5*
	364
	203

	January 2025
	<5*
	483
	290

	February 2025
	<5*
	402
	223

	March 2025
	<5*
	446
	194

	April 2025
	<5*
	438
	234

	May 2025
	5
	406
	204


b. Employment status

This information is not centrally recorded. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

c. Those not in Education, Employment or Training 

This information is not centrally recorded. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

d. Source of referral (e.g. GP, job centre, self-referral) 
Please see appendix attached. 

1. The number of crisis admissions or interventions related to unemployment 
or job loss. 

This information is not centrally recorded. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 

1. The number of hospital admissions or A&E presentations for self-harm or 
attempted suicide. 


	Morriston ED & Neath PT MIU new attendances - self harm/suicide mentioned as an attendance reason 

	
	
	
	

	Department
	2023
	2024
	2025 (to May 25)

	Morriston ED
	2935
	2706
	1051

	Neath Port Talbot MIU
	148
	192
	67




	Of the above - recorded as being admitted to same site / other site within health board

(as recorded on A& E module outcome of attendance)


	
	

	
	
	
	

	Department
	2023
	2024
	2025 (to May 25)

	Morriston ED
	455
	316
	96

	Neath Port Talbot MIU
	13
	6
	<5*

	
	
	
	



Please note, as the Emergency Department (ED) and Minor Injury Unit (MIU) attendance reason is mostly recorded as free text, it is sometimes difficult to answer very specific questions. For this request we have looked for attendances where any mention of "self-harm", '"overdose" or "suicide" is mentioned in their attendance record (along with variations of this wording). In addition to this, flags that are available to indicate "self-harm" have also been used   

Of those identified please specify: 
a. Employment status
[bookmark: _Hlk202783507]This information is not recorded by the Health Board. Employment/education/training status is not a mandatory field/updated on our systems

b. Those not in Education, Employment or Training (NEET) 
See above, 3a
1. Any internal reports, studies, or audits since 2022 examining the mental health impacts of unemployment or economic hardship.
This information is not held by the Health Board. It is possible that Public Health Wales may hold some information that could assist you. Their Freedom of Information email address is: foi.phw@wales.nhs

* Where fewer than 5 has been indicated we are unable to provide you with the exact number of patients as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
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We welcome correspondence in Welsh or English. Welsh language correspondence will be replied to in Welsh, and this will not lead to a delay.
Cadeirydd/Chair: Jan Williams Prif Weithredwr/Chief Executive: Abigail Harris
Pencadlys BIP Bae Abertawe, Un Porthfa Talbot, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR 
Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe yw enw gweithredu Bwrdd Iechyd Lleol Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay UHB Headquarters, One Talbot Gateway, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR
Swansea Bay University Health Board is the operational name of Swansea Bay University Local Health Board
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