[image: C:\Users\su001508\Desktop\New logos Swansea Bay\Abertawe_Swansea NHS Health Board.jpg] Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol Bae Abertawe
Swansea Bay University Health Board
Gwasanaethau Corfforaethol | Corporate Services
Un Porthfa Talbot | One Talbot Gateway
Parc Ynni, Baglan | Baglan Energy Park
Port Talbot SA12 7BR
Ffôn Phone: 01639 684 363

	


Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-F-053






You asked:
I kindly request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 relating to Singleton Hospital for the years 2022, 2023, 2024, and 2025 (to date):
1. Stillbirth and neonatal mortality rates broken down by:
a. Babies' ethnicity
I can confirm that this information is not recorded on our patient information system. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of patient records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time.

b. Mothers’ socio-economic deprivation quintile of residence (preferably using WIMD)
I can confirm that this information is not recorded on our patient information system. WIMD is a system utilised by Welsh Governemt and you would need to contact them for this information. 

2. Number of births where a professional language interpreter was requested or provided (by language, if available).
I can confirm that this information is not recorded.

3. Number of women who arrived at Singleton Hospital in labour without having booked maternity care (i.e., unbooked pregnancies).
I can confirm that this information is not recorded.

4. Number of pregnant or postpartum women referred to:
a. Perinatal mental health services
	 
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025 (To Date)
	Grand Total

	Area
	
	
	
	
	

	PRAMS Swansea                 
	324
	317
	362
	203
	1206

	PRAMS Neath Port Talbot       
	217
	205
	219
	136
	777

	PRAMS - Nursery Nurse         
	10
	63
	95
	45
	213

	PRAMS - Psychology            
	16
	100
	110
	52
	278

	Grand Total
	567
	685
	786
	436
	2474



b. Safeguarding teams
· 2022 referrals/reports Local Authority Safeguarding - 168 
· 2023 referrals/reports to Local Authority Safeguarding - 108
· 2024 referrals/reports to Local Authority Safeguarding - 138
· 1st January 2025 - to date referrals/reports to Local Authority Safeguarding - 63

5. Average monthly number of full-time equivalent midwives employed in the Singleton Hospital maternity unit.
The table below gives the monthly number of full-time equivalent midwives employed in Singleton Midwifery Unit from April 2022 to April 2025:
	
	2022
	2023
	2024
	2025

	January
	
	94.46
	102.21
	106.19

	February
	
	94.08
	103.45
	104.87

	March 
	
	93.97
	103.65
	103.55

	April 
	92.63
	92.60
	100.13
	104.47

	May 
	93.36
	92.36
	99.13
	

	June 
	92.44
	90.92
	97.93
	

	July 
	95.58
	92.32
	97.25
	

	August
	95.58
	91.49
	97.29
	

	September
	94.26
	87.89
	96.13
	

	October
	98.06
	97.13
	104.61
	

	November
	99.06
	100.33
	103.45
	

	December
	97.06
	100.89
	105.35
	



6. Number of reported maternity red flags, staff shortages, or temporary maternity service closures due to safety or capacity concerns.
There were 239 incidents reported.  These incidents relate to staffing issues.

7. Number of formal complaints submitted concerning maternity services, broken down by category if available (e.g., delays in care, cultural insensitivity, patient safety, etc.)
203 complaints. Please see below for break down. Please note that the number of categories (599) will be more than the total number of complaints (203) due to some complaints having more than one issue coded against them

	Year and Subject Code 
	Count of Subject Codes

	2022
	148

	Admissions
	<5*

	Appointments
	<5*

	Attitude and Behaviour
	22

	Cleanliness
	<5*

	Clinical treatment/Assessment
	41

	Communication Issues (including Language)
	31

	Discharge Issues
	<5*

	Equipment
	<5*

	Infection Control
	<5*

	Medication
	13

	Monitoring/Observation Issues
	7

	Nutrition/Hydration Issues
	<5*

	Privacy and Dignity
	<5*

	Record Keeping
	<5*

	Referral
	<5*

	Resources
	<5*

	Test and Investigation Results
	12

	2023
	142

	Admissions
	<5*

	Appointments
	<5*

	Attitude and Behaviour
	19

	Cleanliness
	<5*

	Clinical treatment/Assessment
	50

	Communication Issues (including Language)
	18

	Discharge Issues
	5

	Environment/Facilities
	<5*

	Equipment
	<5*

	Infection Control
	<5*

	Medication
	13

	Monitoring/Observation Issues
	8

	Patient Care
	9

	Record Keeping
	<5*

	Referral
	<5*

	Resources
	<5*

	Skin Damage
	<5*

	Test and Investigation Results
	<5*

	2024
	160

	Access (to Services)
	<5*

	Admissions
	<5*

	Appointments
	<5*

	Assault
	<5*

	Attitude and Behaviour
	12

	Clinical treatment/Assessment
	54

	Communication Issues (including Language)
	22

	Confidentiality
	<5*

	Consent
	<5*

	Discharge Issues
	7

	Equipment
	<5*

	Infection Control
	<5*

	Medication
	15

	Monitoring/Observation Issues
	11

	Nutrition/Hydration Issues
	<5*

	Patient Care
	5

	Record Keeping
	7

	Resources
	<5*

	Skin Damage
	<5*

	Test and Investigation Results
	5

	2025
	149

	Admissions
	7

	Appointments
	5

	Attitude and Behaviour
	14

	Cleanliness
	<5*

	Clinical treatment/Assessment
	43

	Communication Issues (including Language)
	19

	Discharge Issues
	<5*

	Equality
	<5*

	Infection Control
	<5*

	Medication
	13

	Monitoring/Observation Issues
	12

	Nutrition/Hydration Issues
	<5*

	Patient Care
	10

	Post Death Issues
	<5*

	Privacy and Dignity
	<5*

	Record Keeping
	5

	Resources
	<5*

	Test and Investigation Results
	7

	Total
	599



* Where fewer than 5 has been indicated we are unable to provide you with the exact number of patients as due to the low numbers, there is a potential risk of identifying individuals if this was disclosed.  We are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This information is protected by the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute as unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR.  This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
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