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Cais Rhyddid Gwybodaeth / Freedom of Information request
Ein Cyf / Our Ref: 25-C-014





You asked:
1. Does the health board have a wound care clinic?	
Yes	

a. If yes, which hospital/s in the health board are these located at?
Cimla Health and Social Care Centre and Gorseinon Hospital

The Health Board also commissions wound care services from GP Practices in Swansea Bay. 
Simple Wounds - 41 Practices
Complex Wounds - 11 Practices

b. Are these clinic specific clinics? 
If yes, please list. e.g., Diabetic Foot Ulcer (DFU), Burns, acute surgical wounds etc.
No

c. How many patients are seen for wound care per annum? 
In 2023/24 there were 26,228 simple wounds and 1,669 complex wounds were treated by GP practices.
1,588 individual patients were seen in the community wound clinic service.

d. How many operations does the health board perform per annum? 
You clarified on 8th March 2025 that you are referring to all operations, not just those relating to wound care.
	Year
	Operations

	2022
	28885

	2023
	33196

	2024
	33795

	Grand Total
	95876



e. What are your surgical infection rates per annum
I can confirm that this information is not recorded centrally. To obtain this information would involve a manual trawl and search of records which we have estimated would significantly exceed the 18 hours limit set down by the FOI Act as the reasonable limit. Section 12 of the FOI Act and The Freedom of Information and Data Protection (Appropriate Limit and Fees) Regulation 2004 provides that we are not obliged to spend in excess of 18 hours in any sixty day period locating, retrieving and identifying information in order to deal with a request for information and therefore we are withholding this information at this time. 
f. Have you completed a recent wound care audit?
If yes, please supply the date. Could this please be attached? Alternatively, please direct to where this can be found? 
No

g. Are your wound care pathways publicly available?
If yes, could this please be attached. Alternatively, please direct to where this can be found? 
Yes, partially here - https://www.skillsforhealth.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2021/05/Wound-Care-Framework-2021.pdf 

Please also see attachments 1 and 2.


2. Health Care Professionals

	Wound care HCP
	Number Permanently Employed
	Salary Band
	How many temp/locum district nurses, TVN or HCA’s have been employed over the last 12 months.

	How many district nurses are employed in the health board?
	214
	Band 5
Band 6
Band 7
Band 8a
Band 8b
	4

	How many Tissue Viability Nurse (TVN) are employed by the health board?

	2
	Band 6
Band 7
	0

	How many community facing Health Care Assistants (HCA) are employed by the health board?
	246
	Band 2
Band 3
Band 4
	3



3. Wound Care Products List. 
The attached list contains the most relevant products, we do not anticipate all these being used in your health board, please fill in accordingly and return with this questionnaire

Please see attached spreadsheet “dressings formulary” which you may use to cross reference against the products listed.


4. Wound Care Products

a. How many Vacuum Assisted Closure (VAC) or Negative Pressure Device (NPD)/System therapy pumps are owned/contracted?
Please see appendix attached “VAC NPD”

b. How much is the service contract amount per year? 
Smith and Nephew and HLD units are serviced by the SBU Medical Physics & Clinical Engineering department, there is no service contract. 
Madela units have no service contract.

c. How many of these are in repair/lost?
I can confirm this information is not held.

d. If known, what is the cost of repair not under a service contract? 
Not applicable – these are repaired by our Medical Physics & Clinical Engineering department

e. What was the price paid per unit for a VAC/NPD?
This information is withheld.
Section 43 of the Act sets out an exemption for the right to know if release of the information is likely to prejudice the commercial interests of any person (a person may be an individual, a company, the public authority itself or any other legal entity).  Section 43 is a qualified exemption.  That is, it is subject to the public interest test. 

The Health Board accepts that there is a public interest in ensuring openness and transparency and there is an interest in the public being aware of how much money is spent and the benefits derived from that expenditure.  However, the Health Board believes that disclosure of information in a manner which fails to protect the interests and relationships arising in a commercial context could have the effect of discouraging companies from dealing with the Health Board because of fears that the disclosure of information could damage them commercially.  In turn this could then jeopardise the Health Boards ability to compete fairly and pursue its function to bring forward development in the area and obtain value for money.  It was therefore decided that it is not in the publics’ interest to disclose this information.


f. What is your annual spend on consumables for the VAC/NPD?
Nil – these are not repaired on site, they are send back to the company for repair.

5. Health Board Research and Development

a. How many wound related trials have you participated in over the last 5 years?
One

b. How many of those were commercially led trials?
One

c. How many of those were academic/internally led trials?
Nil

d. What is the average turnaround time for commercial R&D approval?
32 days from receipt of full application to sign off for this study.
__________________________________________________________ 
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